ABSTRACT OF BIDS

TREE AND BRUSH THINNING

SB-FP-04-2526

Bidder's Name Bluestem Ecological Services Da:z;e,s;:rce ENCAP, Inc. o,,:giﬁ;i%}:%? ul n::::;:"::’:':l::: Pizzo and Associated, Ltd. Vs COnstr::(t’i.on Group, Woods to Wetlands

City, State Marengo, IL Elmhurst, IL DeKalb, IL Chicago, IL Waukegan, IL Leland, IL Woodridge, IL || Streamwood, IL

Project 1: Aurora West Forest Preserve- 62.4 acres No Bid $85,614.00 || $34,320.00 $35,700.00 $35,748.00 $18,308.00 $43,710.00 No Bid
Project 2: Burnidge Forest Preserve- 53 acres $50,110.00 $130,053.80 | $31,005.00 $34,100.00 $34,350.00 $24,913.00 $56,800.00 No Bid
Project 3: Dick Young Forest Preserve - 77.6 acres No Bid $108,915.00 | $48,500.00 $39,500.00 $28,900.00 $28,892.00 $53,260.00 No Bid
Project 4: Schweitzer Woods Forest Preserve - 42.3 acres $47,610.00 $102,054.00 || $23,265.00 $28,500.00 $70,232.00 $44,866.00 $32,760.00 No Bid
Project 5: Bliss Woods Forest Preserve- 46.7 acres No Bid No Bid $112,080.00 || $82,700.00 $126,954.00 $55,295.00 $86,928.00 No Bid
Project 6: Bliss Woods Forest Preserve - 21.8 acres No Bid No Bid $52,320.00 $44,700.00 No Bid $31,310.00 $136,260.00 No Bid
Project 7: Bowes Creek Greenway - 3.7 acres $8,790.00 $24,661.00 | $16,650.00 $30,900.00 No Bid $61,856.00 $18,075.00 No Bid
Project 8: Elburn Forest Preserve- 39.2 acres $76,015.00 No Bid $101,920.00 | $73,900.00 $94,515.00 $47,378.00 $84,720.00 No Bid
Project 9: Pingree Grove Forest Preserve- 13 acres $9,020.00 $28,405.00 | $18,850.00 $19,400.00 $14,870.00 $175,970.00 $20,176.00 $28,199.00
Project 10: Pingree Grove Forest Preserve- 10.2 acres $6,225.00 $27,535.00 | $12,240.00 $15,000.00 $14,960.00 $117,803.00 $12,160.00 $20,398.00
Project 11: Stearns Road Forest Preserve- 12.1 acres $20,900.00 No Bid $35,090.00 $22,400.00 No Bid $29,999.00 $19,968.00 No Bid
Project 12: Virgil Forest Preserve- 5.4 acres $9,920.00 No Bid $56,700.00 No Bid No Bid $18,112.00 $58,520.00 No Bid
Project 13: Raceway Woods Forest Preserve- 25.5 acres $73,420.00 $73,654.00 | $96,900.00 $95,700.00 No Bid $40,361.00 $95,220.00 No Bid
Project 14: Raceway Woods- 11.2 acres $42,055.00 $39,588.00 | $42,560.00 $73,900.00 No Bid $23,690.00 $94,350.00 No Bid

1 have certified that | have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation

David Petschke, Director of Finance




