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KANE COUNTY

SB-FP-17-2526

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

CATTAIL - PHRAGMITE WEED MANAGEMENT

) . Tigris Aquatic | Bluestem Ecological| Integrated Lakes Pizzo and
Bidder's Name ) . .
Services Solutions Management, Inc.|| Associated, Ltd.
City, State Carol Stream, IL Marengo, IL Waukegan, IL Leland, IL
Project 1: Aurora West Forest Preserve - 28 Acres $9,212.00 No Bid $12,975.48 No Bid
Project 2: Bracburn Marsh Forest Preserve - 3 Acres $3,090.00 No Bid $11,817.09 $5,049.99
Project 3: Freeman Kame Forest Preserve - 49 Acres $17,101.00 $24,500.00 No Bid $49,698.25
Project 4: Hannaford Woods Forest Preserve - 19 Acres $5,890.00 No Bid $10,698.33 $15,119.85
Project 5: Oakhurst Forest Preserve - 12 Acres $4,596.00 No Bid $12,023.28 $11,220.00
Project 6: Stearns Road Forest Preserve - 57 Acres $14,820.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Project 7: Willoughby Farms Forest Preserve - 4 Acres $3,140.00 $2,000.00 $6,939.16 No Bid
Project 8: Rutland North Forest Preserve - 17 Acres $5,100.00 $76,500.00 $15,236.25 No Bid

| have certified that | have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation
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Davia Petschke, Director of Finance




