SB-FP-06-2526

ABSTRACT OF BIDS

HERBICIDE WEED MANAGEMENT: 9 PROJECTS WITHIN 8 PRESERVES

Bidder's Name

Bluestem Ecological

Davey Resource Group

Integrated Lakes

: ENCAP, Inc. Pizzo and Associated, Ltd. | Tallgrass Restoration, LLC.| Woods to Wetlands
Solutions Inc Management, Inc.
City’ State Marengo, IL Elmhurst, IL DeKalb, IL Waukegan, IL Leland, i Schaumburg, 1L Streamwood, IL

Project 1: Big Rock FP Big Rock, IL 50.1 Acres 3 33,360.08 | & 32,715.30 34,318.50 No Bid | $ 42,195.22 No Bid No Bid
Project 2: Bliss Woods FP Sugar Grove, IL 56.4 Acres 4 33,250.05 | $ 32,881.20 34,686.00 53,424.34 | $ 53,241.60 | § 30,738.00 No Bid
Project 3: Bowes Creek Greenway Elgin, IL 4.7 Acres 5 3,070.98 | $ 4,944.40 No Bid NoBid | $ 7,125.20 | & 3,562.60 | $ 3,932.02
Project 4: Burnidge FP Eigin, IL 24 Acres $ 15,910.08 | $ 17,928.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 24,780.00 | $ 15,888.00 | § 13,394.88
Project 5: Dick Young FP Batavia, IL 94.6 Acres S 40,671.38 | $ 61,395.40 No Bid 59,447.59 | § 24,886.11 | 53,354.40 No Bid
Project 6: Grunwald FP Elburn, IL 32.7 Acres S 22,753.96 | S 20,699.10 22,563.00 26,521.01 | $ 30,983.25 | $ 29,658.90 $17,942.49*
Project 7: Hampshire FP Hampshire, IL 76.1 Acres S 38,846.00 | $ 52,813.40 No Bid NoBid | $ 78,573.25 | § 36,375.80 No Bid
Project 8: Settler's Hill Golf Course Geneva, Il. 18 Acres S 10,177.92 | S 12,366.00 No Bid NoBid | § 23,760.00 No Bid | § 8,989.20
Project 9: Big Rock FP_Big Rock, IL 43.4 Acres S 26,579.89 | § 25,041.80 29,512.00 32,985.32 | $ 41,121.50 No Bid No Bid
*Project will not proceed due to budget constraints
Total Project Amounts Awarded $175,212.07 S 3,07098 § 57,757.10 - - S 24,886.11 $ 67,113.80 $ 22,384.08

I have certified that | have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation

David Petschke, Director of Finance




