



ABSTRACT OF BIDS

TREE AND BRUSH THINNING - 10 Projects

Project Number: SB-FP-18-2526

Bidder's Name	Bluestem Ecological Services	Semper Fi Land Service	CLEAN CUT TREE SERVICE INC	Central Tree & Landscape Mutch, LLC	Davey Resource Group Inc	ENCAP, Inc.	HGS, LLC dba RES Environmental Operating Company, LLC	Homer Tree Service, Inc	Integrated Lakes Management, Inc.	Pizzo and Associated, Ltd.	V3 Construction Group, Ltd.	Woods to Wetlands
City, State	Marengo, IL	Sugar Grove, IL	Grayslake, IL	Pingree Grove, IL	Elmhurst, IL	DeKalb, IL	Chicago, IL	Lockport, IL	Waukegan, IL	Leland, IL	Woodridge, IL	Streamwood, IL
Project 1: Aurora West Forest Preserve - Aurora, IL - 63.5 Acres	\$17,992.09	\$55,005.61	\$133,350.00	\$117,411.50	\$67,881.50	\$44,450.00	\$51,308.00	No Bid	\$35,412.05	\$120,608.09	No Bid	No Bid
Project 2: Bowes Creek Greenway - Elgin, IL - 14.4 Acres	\$15,811.78	\$20,886.91	\$97,920.00	\$68,385.60	\$37,252.80	\$54,720.00	\$30,297.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$66,945.60	No Bid	No Bid
Project 3: Johnson's Mound Forest Preserve - Elburn, IL - 19.7 Acres	\$43,212.74	\$31,739.85	\$120,170.00	\$65,995.00	\$45,507.00	\$68,950.00	\$65,364.60	\$128,050.00	No Bid	\$63,775.80	\$102,440.00	No Bid
Project 4: Johnson's Mound Forest Preserve - Elburn, IL - 11.9 Acres	\$25,958.78	\$23,776.20	\$72,590.00	\$39,865.00	\$28,203.00	\$41,650.00	\$41,162.10	\$77,350.00	No Bid	\$45,106.59	\$69,020.00	No Bid
Project 5: Meissner-Corron Forest Preserve - St. Charles, IL - 6 Acres	\$30,762.90	\$11,945.70	\$48,996.00	\$46,200.00	No Bid	\$49,200.00	\$36,924.00	\$33,000.00	No Bid	\$28,960.62	No Bid	No Bid
Project 6: Schweitzer Woods Forest Preserve - Dundee, IL - 17.9 Acres	\$18,218.08	\$27,836.11	\$76,970.00	\$35,442.00	\$33,473.00	\$48,330.00	\$28,783.20	No Bid	\$59,852.77	\$42,692.40	No Bid	\$46,217.80
Project 7: Raceway Woods Forest Preserve - Carpentersville, IL - 7.8 Acres	\$21,831.03	\$11,963.72	\$53,040.00	\$38,563.20	\$23,868.00	\$52,650.00	\$35,061.00	\$50,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Project 8: Settler's Hill Golf Course - Geneva, IL - 18.7 Acres	\$17,854.39	\$24,363.67	\$86,020.00	\$69,938.00	\$28,237.00	\$45,815.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$65,277.21	No Bid	No Bid	\$49,844.85
Project 9: McLean Road Fen Forest Preserve - South Elgin, IL - 1.1 Acres	\$23,129.00	\$5,953.86	No Bid	\$19,690.00	No Bid	\$13,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9,256.85	No Bid	\$28,199.00
Project 10: Virgil Forest Preserve - Virgil, IL - 5.4 Acres	Withdrawn	Withdrawn	No Bid	Withdrawn	No Bid	Withdrawn	No Bid	Withdrawn	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Withdrawn
Grand Total by Vendor	\$69,876.34	\$85,379.33										

I have certified that I have opened, read and recorded all bids received in response to the invitation

David Petschke, Chief Financial & Administrative Officer